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The bikes featured in the Bike EXIF Calendar 2015 were crafted by artisan builders from around the world.
They stem from varied backgrounds and take distinctive approaches, but all produce brilliant results. For the
guys at Wrenchmonkees this meant drawing upon 16 years of experience to produce a unique and stunning
Laverda 750. In the case of Bill Costello, his BMW R100T Custom was only his second build. With the help
of local craftsmen at an auto interior shop, a machinist and a wheel maker, Bill was able to create a
thoroughly impressive bike. Another commonality of all the builders was their focus to do whatever
necessary to achieve their vision of the perfect bike. For Christian Schwarzenlander of ExesoR this meant
sourcing the basis for his Honda CB Café Racer on eBay for a mere $340.00. In contrast, Max Hazan crafted
his Harley Ironhead entirely from scratch to build without compromising the design. Featured Bikes January
- BMW R100T Feburary - Honda CB Cafe Racer March - Moto Guzzi V50 Monza April - Kawasaki
Kamikaze Cafe Racer May - Laverda 750 June - Honda CB Cafe Racer July - Triumph Bonneville August -
The Sprintbeemer September - Honda XL 500 October - Kawasaki W650 Scrambler November - BMW
R1200S December - Suzuki ST400
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From reader reviews:

Linda Shell:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These are
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Bike EXIF Custom Motorcycle Calendar 2015 (Multilingual
Edition).

Shane Ward:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Bike EXIF Custom Motorcycle
Calendar 2015 (Multilingual Edition) book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is
usually more than just a book.

Guadalupe Baum:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others.
When you read this Bike EXIF Custom Motorcycle Calendar 2015 (Multilingual Edition), it is possible to
tells your family, friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones,
make them reading a reserve.

Beverly Thomas:

Bike EXIF Custom Motorcycle Calendar 2015 (Multilingual Edition) can be one of your starter books that
are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary which
could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing Bike EXIF
Custom Motorcycle Calendar 2015 (Multilingual Edition) although doesn't forget the main place, giving the
reader the hottest and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great



information can drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.
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