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In this engrossing, provocative, and intimate memoir, a young journalist reflects on her childhood in the
heartland, growing up in an increasingly isolated meditation community in the 1980s and ’90s—a
fascinating, disturbing look at a fringe culture and its true believers.

When Claire Hoffman’s alcoholic father abandons his family, his desperate wife, Liz, tells five-year-old
Claire and her seven-year-old brother, Stacey, that they are going to heaven—Iowa—to live in Maharishi’s
national headquarters for Heaven on Earth. For Claire’s mother, Transcendental Meditation—the
Maharishi’s method of meditation and his approach to living the fullest possible life—was a salvo that
promised world peace and enlightenment just as their family fell apart.

At first this secluded utopia offers warmth and support, and makes these outsiders feel calm, secure, and
connected to the world. At the Maharishi School, Claire learns Maharishi’s philosophy for living and
meditates with her class. With the promise of peace and enlightenment constantly on the horizon, every day
is infused with magic and meaning. But as Claire and Stacey mature, their adolescent skepticism kicks in,
drawing them away from the community and into delinquency and drugs. To save herself, Claire moves to
California with her father and breaks from Maharishi completely. After a decade of working in journalism
and academia, the challenges of adulthood propel her back to Iowa, where she reexamines her spiritual
upbringing and tries to reconnect with the magic of her childhood.

Greetings from Utopia Park takes us deep into this complex, unusual world, illuminating its joys and
comforts, and its disturbing problems. While there is no utopia on earth, Hoffman reveals, there are noble
goals worth striving for: believing in belief, inner peace, and a firm understanding that there is a larger fabric
of the universe to which we all belong.
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From reader reviews:

Billy Benitez:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Greetings from Utopia Park:
Surviving a Transcendent Childhood will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think that open or reading any book make
you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or
appropriate book with you?

Daryl Thurmond:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
any time those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Greetings from Utopia Park: Surviving a Transcendent
Childhood as your daily resource information.

James Brady:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Greetings from Utopia Park: Surviving a
Transcendent Childhood e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that
can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty Greetings from Utopia Park:
Surviving a Transcendent Childhood as good book not just by the cover but also through the content. This is
one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet
another sixth sense.

Ingrid Baumbach:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book
Greetings from Utopia Park: Surviving a Transcendent Childhood. You can include your knowledge by it.
Without departing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is
most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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