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Would you call Alice Teakle a stalker? Or just someone with an, um, healthy obsession with golden girl
Polly Linley Dawson? No one much notices Alice: not her boss, not the neighbors, not even her Mother.

Besides, everyone follows Polly: her business selling high-end lingerie you can imagine only her elegant self
wearing, her all-over-the-social-pages marriage to movie director Humphrey Dawson, her chic looks, her
wardrobe. Alice just follows her a little more….closely.

And when she loses her job and starts to follow Polly Dawson one Manhattan autumn afternoon, Alice
stumbles on the object of her attention sprawled dead on the floor of a boutique. Alice is forced to become
truly beneath anyone's notice. Invisible, in fact. Because she's accused of murder.

But can another obsession help save Alice with the fallout? Charlie is Alice's longtime unattainable crush.
He might be able to help her out of the mess she's in…in return for a favor or two, that is. And how will
Alice find out if Charlie is really the man Alice thinks he is?
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From reader reviews:

John Caldwell:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Following Polly: A Novel e-book
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt Following Polly: A Novel as good book but
not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't determine book by
its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at
sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Anna Rangel:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Following Polly: A Novel can be the response, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-
new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Walter Taylor:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What
you are related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of
several books in the top record in your reading list is definitely Following Polly: A Novel. This book and that
is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward
and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Terry Klatt:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social just
like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find the
Following Polly: A Novel when you needed it?
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